COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

ARTICLE IV. ZONE DISTRICTS AND PERMITTED USES*

Sec. 26-91. General.

(a) Purpose. This article divides the city into "zone districts" of such number, shape, and area,
and common unity of purpose or use as are deemed most suitable to effectively accomplish the
intent of the Steamboat Springs Area Community Plan. Each zone district has a stated
purpose and intent, uses by right, uses with criteria, and conditional uses specific to that zone
district. All development within each zone district shall be consistent with the purpose and
intent stated for such zone district and with all applicable provisions of this CDC.

(b) Applicability of zone district regulations. Except as may be otherwise provided in this
chapter:

(1) No structure shall be erected, reconstructed, altered, enlarged, or moved, nor shall any
building or land be used for any purpose other than for a use permitted, permitted with
criteria, conditionally permitted, or as an accessory or temporary use in the zone
district in which it is located.

(2) No structure shall be erected, reconstructed, altered, enlarged, or moved unless it
conforms to the area regulations of the zone district in which it is located and/or other
requirements of this CDC.

(3) No setback or other open space required in this CDC for any structure shall be
considered as providing a setback or open space for any other structure, and no setback
or open space on an adjoining lot or parcel shall be considered as providing a setback
or open space on a lot on which a building is to be erected, unless such use of setback
area measurements is approved through the use of a final plat or final development
plan for an "offset side yard/zero lot line" development.

(4) No structure shall be erected, reconstructed, altered, enlarged, or moved, nor shall any
building or land be used for any purpose unless a final development plan, or
development permit for the structure, building, or land, has been properly issued in
accordance with the provisions of this CDC. This provision shall not apply to
single-family attached and detached homes located within approved final subdivision
plats that comply with all requirements of this CDC, section 26-68, final plat, and any
previous approved final plat.

(c) Zone districts established. In conformity with the purpose and intent of this CDC and the
Steamboat Springs Area Community Plan, the following zone districts are hereby created:

(1) Standard zone districts.
a. OR - Open space and recreation zone district.
1.  Purpose and intent. The open space and recreation zone district is intended

primarily to provide areas for public or private recreational uses, open space

*Editor’s note—Ord. No. 2187, § 1, adopted June 3, 2008, amended Art. IV in its entirety
to read as herein set out. Former Art. IV, §§ 26-91—26-130, pertained to similar subject matter.
See the Code Comparative Table for full derivation.

Supp. No. 22 1834.9



§ 26-91

d.

Supp. No. 22

STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

preservation, or other similar uses. This zone district may include protection
of environmentally sensitive areas such as wetlands, floodplains, rivers and
streams, development buffers, or public recreation facilities such as parks,
athletic fields, ski areas, and community gathering spaces.

RE - Residential estate zone district.

1.

2.

Purpose and intent. The residential estate zone district is intended primar-
ily to provide areas for single-family detached living in a low-density
environment. This district may be appropriate for environmentally sensitive
areas, and is best located away from high-density development

Designations. Each property zoned RE must have a designation of "1" or "2"
that further specifies the intensity and density of such use as provided by
this article. Secondary units are allowed as a use with criteria in both the
RE-1 and RE-2 zones. The designations are as follows:

i. RE-1 residential estate, low density; and

ii. RE-2 residential estate, higher density;

RN - Residential neighborhood zone district.

1.

2.

Purpose and intent. The residential neighborhood zone district is intended
primarily to provide areas for single-family, duplex and accessory dwelling
units in a range of residential densities, as well as to provide uses
complimentary to and in harmony with residential uses. The RN zone
district has four (4) designations that allow for different levels of intensity
and density. New development should be compatible with existing surround-
ing neighborhoods in terms of lot size and density.

Designations. Each property zoned RN must have a designation of "1," "2,",
"3" or "4" that further specifies the intensity and density of such use as
provided by this article. The designations are as follows:

i. RN-1 residential neighborhood, low density;

ii.  RN-2 residential neighborhood, moderate density;

iii. RN-3 residential neighborhood, high density; and

iv. RN-4 residential neighborhood, high density - small lot.

RO - Residential Old Town zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The residential Old Town zone district is intended
primarily to provide development compatible with the traditional residen-
tial character of the city's original neighborhoods in terms of mass, height,
setback, density, and street layout. This includes a range of residential uses
generally found on smaller lots, including a limited number of multi-family,
accommodation units, educational and institutional uses.

1834.10



e.

Supp. No. 21

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

RR - Residential resort zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The purpose of the residential resort district is to
provide areas for the highest intensity of residential use consistent with a
mountain resort community. The primary use of dwelling units within this
district may be for short-term rental units. New development shall be
physically connected to the resort by an integrated system of streets,
sidewalks and recreational paths. The RR zone district functions as a
gateway to the resort, and new development should have a resort-like
character with lower development intensity and scale for development
located further away from the base area, with intensities and densities
increasing with the increased proximity to the base area. The RR zone
district has two (2) designations that allow for different levels of intensity
and density. The designation that allows higher levels of intensity is
principally located immediately adjacent to the ski slopes.

Designations. Each property zoned RR must have a designation of "1," or "2"
that further specifies the intensity and density of such use as provided by
this article. The designations are as follows:

i.  RR-1 residential resort, low density; and

ii. RR-2 residential resort, high density.

MH - Mobile home zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The mobile home zone district is intended to secure and
broaden future affordable housing opportunities for permanent residents of
the city. This zone district applies to mobile home parks and mobile home
subdivisions.

MF - Multi-family residential zone district.

1.

2.

Purpose and intent. The multi-family residential zone district is intended
primarily to provide areas for development of multi-family housing in a
range of densities. Such housing may include townhouses, condominiums,
and apartments. These developments shall take measures to ensure com-
patibility with adjacent properties of lower densities, as well as to provide
adequate open space.

Designations. Where any property is zoned MF, such property shall also
include a designation identifying the intensity and density of such use as
provided by this article. Such designations include the following:

i. MF-1 multi-family low density;
ii.  MF-2 multi-family medium density;

iii. MF-3 multi-family high density;

G-1 - Gondola one zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The purpose of the Gondola one zone district is intended
to provide residential accommodation for guests, second homeowners, and

1834.11



§ 26-91

1.

j-

k.

Supp. No. 21

STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

new residents looking for a high-level of amenities as provided by a resort
environment. New development shall be physically connected to the resort
by an integral system of streets, sidewalks, and recreational paths. New
development should have a resort-like character with higher development
intensity and scale than development within the RR districts, but lower
intensity than the G-2 district. All development in the G-1 zone district shall
require approval of a PUD and shall be subject to the provisions of section
26-86.

G-2 - Gondola two zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The purpose of the Gondola two zone district is for
properties nearest to the Gondola base facility to have the densest develop-
ment in the city. Because of the special characteristics and importance of
this area to the general welfare of the city, this zone district is intended to
allow for flexibility and creativity in the development of land in order to
provide a quality pedestrian-oriented environment that furthers the goals of
the master plans for the area. Special emphasis shall be placed on the
location of uses within structures, the massing and design of structures, the
provision of public spaces and gathering areas, pedestrian corridors and
how those elements relate with the pedestrian environment. Multi-use
buildings, with pedestrian-oriented ground-level retail and other active
uses, are strongly encouraged in the G-2 zone district. All development in
the G-2 zone district shall require approval of a PUD and shall be subject to
the provisions in section 26-86.

CO - Commercial Old Town zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The commercial Old Town zone district is intended
primarily to provide areas for commercial development compatible with the
scale, character and streetscape of the traditional downtown area of the city.
Appropriate land uses include public facilities, commercial retail, primarily
on the street and pedestrian level, with office and/or residential uses above
or below the street level. Portions of the area may be appropriate for
inclusion in a local or other cultural resource designation. The uses,
structures, and project design should focus on providing an interesting
pedestrian experience that has variety and vitality and that is not depen-
dent upon direct vehicular access or immediately adjacent parking.

CY - Yampa Street commercial zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The Yampa Street commercial zone district is designed
and intended primarily for properties with frontage along Yampa Street and
has been identified as an area with significant redevelopment and new
development potential with the ability to impact the overall image and
future vitality of Old Town. The CY zone district is intended to allow
development and redevelopment as a commercially active neighborhood

1834.12



Supp. No. 21

CN

cc

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

that is distinctly different than Lincoln Avenue with high-quality, unique
mixed-use developments, moderate intensity commercial uses, restaurants,
retail, lodging and residential dwelling units. Uses and structures in this
area shall generally be of a smaller scale and pedestrian oriented. The
district is intended to serve locals and visitors alike who want to enjoy the
mix of urban and natural environments that is possible in this unique area
of the city. Visual connections to the Yampa River are of high priority and all
development and redevelopment is encouraged to actively engage the
riverfront in building and site design through methods such as outdoor
seating, decks, porches or other interactive design techniques. Public access
and physical connections to the riverfront should be encouraged whenever
possible. The district also serves to provide a smooth transition from the
commercial downtown to the recreation and open space resources of Howelsen
Park.

Commercial neighborhood zone district.

Purpose and intent. The commercial neighborhood zone district is designed
and intended to provide mixed-use areas for low intensity commercial,
limited retail, and residential dwelling units. Uses and structures in this
area shall generally be of a smaller scale, pedestrian and neighborhood
oriented, and provide services for the local population. Along Oak Street,
adaptive re-use of older residential buildings is encouraged in order to
preserve the residential scale. The preservation and enhancement of the
street tree canopy is encouraged through the addition of new street trees
and preservation of existing mature trees. While locating uses along Oak
Street, consideration should be given to placing higher scale and intensity
uses on the south side of the street and lower scale and intensity uses along
the north side of the street. Through considerations such as intensity and
scale, an emphasis shall be placed on providing appropriate transition areas
and pedestrian connections into and from neighboring uses.

Community commercial zone district.

Purpose and intent. The community commercial zone district is designed
and intended primarily to provide nodes for commercial services and sale of
goods for residents and visitors, as well as nodes for office, lodging and
residential development. An emphasis shall be placed on minimizing the
impact of vehicular traffic through the provision of low intensity commercial
development, encouraging a mix of complementary uses that might reduce
single-purpose automobile trips, mitigation of the aesthetic impact of
parking lots, utilization of joint access between properties, and the provision
of safe, efficient and well-connected pedestrian, bicycle and transit facilities.
Along U.S. Highway 40, development and redevelopment is encouraged to
allow visual and physical connections to the Yampa River and Yampa River
Core Trail and to present a high-quality street frontage with landscaped

1834.13



§ 26-91

0.

P.

Supp. No. 21

CS

STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

buffers and open space areas. Consideration shall be given to providing a
quality entryway into the city, reducing visual clutter with respect to
signage and lighting and discouraging strip commercial type of develop-
ment. Commercial development is intended to be focused around signalized
intersections with concentrations of low intensity office, residential and
lodging development between those signalized intersections.

Commercial services zone district.

Purpose and intent. The commercial services zone district is designed and
intended to provide areas for commercial services and goods primarily for
residents. While uses may be of a higher intensity and automobile oriented,
efforts shall be taken to minimize vehicular conflicts and improve visual
appearances from passing motorists and pedestrians. Adequate pedestrian,
transit facilities and alternative modes of transportation shall be included to
encourage nonvehicular access.

I - Industrial zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The industrial zone district is designed and intended to
accommodate industrial uses with varying degrees of impacts. Uses allowed
by right are generally those that are conducted entirely within an enclosed
structure and have no negative impacts beyond the property where the use
is located. Uses with criteria are generally those that may have outdoor
operations and visual or environmental impacts that can be mitigated
through application of additional requirements. Conditional uses are gen-
erally those uses that may have offsite impacts and therefore require
specific mitigation to minimize those impacts.

TND - Traditional neighborhood development zone district.

1.

Purpose and intent. The traditional neighborhood development (TND)
zoning designation is intended to provide options and standards for devel-
opment that emphasize the features of traditional neighborhoods. As such,
the traditional neighborhood is intended to accommodate, encourage, and
promote innovatively designed developments involving residential and
nonresidential land uses, which together form an attractive and harmonious
mixed-use development with an internally consistent hierarchy of building
and street types using traditional neighborhood development (TND) princi-
ples. Such a development may be designed as a large scale separate entity
able to function as an individual neighborhood or as a smaller scale infill
project.

Applicability. The TND zone applies to all lands within the City of
Steamboat Springs with the TND zoning designation according to the
official city zoning map. All land within the West of Steamboat Springs Area
Plan (WSSAP) boundaries are to be zoned as TND at time of annexation.

1834.14



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

Other parcels within the City of Steamboat Springs municipal boundaries
may be rezoned to TND zoning through section 26-62, official zoning map
amendments.

Transect. The form-based code standards utilize the rural-to-urban transect
as a basis for the organization of development character and intensity
within the TND zone district (see graphic below). The transect is a concept
providing a framework that identifies a continuous range of habitats from
most natural to most urban. In this case, the transect has been carefully
calibrated to reflect the physical form and character of the City of Steamboat
Springs. The transect permeates each form-based code standard, providing
a clear hierarchy that facilitates and directs future planning and design
decisions. The location of individual transects is depicted on a regulating
plan. The transects are generally illustrated as follows:

amily
i Bungalow/Green Courts Live/Wodk =
Meditum Lot Single Family 6 Live/Work
Lo Large Lot Single Family Lasge Lot Single Family Small lot Single Famuily TD"""“_‘ ;ﬂm‘ Retall, Service, Assembly
"T;"f Medium Lot Single Family Duplexes n"m‘h"r m“"‘_ T !d'_t:ﬂ“' ¥ i Industrial (limited)
Bungalow/Green Courts LiveWo rk. Large Tennt Comamercial Mixed-Use/Commercial Block
Mixed-Use/Commercial Block
Single Family Small Single Family ‘Multi-Family
Single Family Mulg-Family (limied) Mulg-Family Live/ Wozk Live/Work
A ¢ Dwelling Units General Service (very limited) General Service (limited) Live/Work Retail, Service, Assembly 1 (mited)
Uses : “;:’:-‘m, mj‘; Asserbly (limited) Assembly (limited) Retail, Service, Assembly (lizited) Industrial (lizited) ol e
Aeits ;:ﬁ . Acesssory Dwelling Unis Accessory Dwelling Units Industrial (limited) Large Footprint Retail (limited) mmﬁ’"ml_m"
£ o Parks, Playerounds Community Housing Units Commumity Housing Units Community Housing Units = 7
Parizs, Playgrounds Parks, Playgrounds Parizs, Plazas, Playgrounds
Applicable standards. The TND zone district has distinct standards that
emphasize physical form over land use. These include building form
standards (see article V, section 26-152), building type standards (see article
V, section 26-153), and subdivision standards (see article VII, section
26-187). Unlike many conventional development codes, form-based code
standards place a primary emphasis on the physical form and character of
new development, with a strong but secondary emphasis on the uses within
Supp. No. 21 1834.15



§ 26-91

Supp. No. 21

STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

buildings. The City of Steamboat Springs form-based code standards have
been carefully calibrated to ensure that different land use intensities and
degrees of mixed-use can be implemented in a manner that minimizes
potential conflicts between incompatible land uses, and results in a consis-
tent, high-quality public realm that supports the development over time of
a series of neighborhoods that are relatively dense, mixed-use, and pedestrian-
oriented.

The form-based code standards are prescriptive in order to provide a certain
degree of predictability and consistency with the SSACP's vision. At the
same time, the Code provides a certain degree of flexibility that can support
a great variety of future physical outcomes, as well as the opportunity for
mixed-use neighborhoods to evolve over time.

Transect designations. A series of form-based transect designations distrib-
ute densities and land use intensities across the TND zone district. The
transects allocate allowable land uses, buildable areas, required frontage
conditions, and allowed building types as follows:

T2-NE

: WL L] ol T
W'l:lﬂﬂ"?ﬁ%

I LSAL
.

|

Neighborhood Edge

T2-NE: Neighborhood Edge supplies an appropriate transition at the edge of the
community to the surrounding lower intensity uses. This designation provides a
choice of large-lot single-family residences to members of the community and
grants the option of larger homes within the context of a neighborhood structure.

1834.16



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

i “ ""W F‘f

el

Nnigl\bml\oo:' General - Low

T3-NG1: Neighborhood General - Low supplies the core residential fabric within
neighborhoods. This designation provides a variety of single-family, duplex and
limited multi-family housing types to enable a wide diversity of residences on
small to large lots.

Supp. No. 21 1834.17



§ 26-91 STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

T3-NG2: Neighborhood General - Medium supplies residential fabric at greater
densities within neighborhoods. This designation provides a variety of single-
family, duplex and multi-family housing types to enable a wide diversity of
residences on small and medium lots.

Supp. No. 21 1834.18



Supp. No. 21

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

T4-NC: Neighborhood Center is a mixed-use area intended to provide a choice of
higher density housing units, locally serving retail within walking distance of
where residents live. Neighborhood Centers are intended to primarily support
the needs of the neighborhood residents. They are accessible by transit and will
often include one or more well-designed transit stops.

1834.19



§ 26-91

Supp. No. 21

STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

i e e —
| ',. i ——

T5-TC: Town Core is a mixed-use area intended to provide a choice of higher
density housing units, regional serving retail, and supporting commercial uses.
This designation is accessible by transit and will often include one or more
well-designed transit stops. They are located at or near primary intersections to

attract both pedestrians and drive-by traffic.

1834.20



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-91

LN
wEE
e .

SD: Special District provides a space for uses and/or building types that may not
be appropriate in other transects. These uses include public and institutional
uses and limited industrial uses within the context of a pedestrian oriented area
adjacent to a neighborhood centers.

6. Regulating plan. The allocation of transect zones is determined and indi-
cated on a regulating plan. See subsection 26-90(c) for applicable criteria.

(2) Overlay zone districts. All properties, or portions of properties, located within the
boundaries of the city and designated within the above-referenced overlay zone on its
respective map, are determined to be part of such overlay zone and subject to the
applicable rules and regulations as stated in this article IV.

AO - Airport overlay zone district (reserved).
SO - Skyline overlay zone district.

1. Purpose and intent. The intent of the skyline overlay zone is to establish
appropriate standards for the development of property containing a visually
significant skyline as viewed from designated public vantage points and as
identified on the official zoning map.

DCR - Downtown cultural resource overlay zone district (reserved).
d. LFR - Large format retail overlay district.

1.  Purpose and intent. The large format use overlay is intended to designate an
area within the TND zone district that may be appropriate to accommodate
a large format retail project.

Supp. No. 22 1834.21



§ 26-91 STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

(d) Official zoning map adoption. The boundaries of the zoning districts are delineated upon
the official zoning map of the city. The map is hereby adopted as a part of this article as if the
map were set forth in this article in detail. The official zoning map shall supersede all zoning
maps previously adopted by the city to the extent and only to the extent that the maps are in
conflict with the map adopted in this article. The official zoning map shall be filed in the offices
of the department of planning and community development and bear the signature of the
director and the seal of the city, and be attested by the city clerk.

(1) Administrative determination. Any owner may, upon request, obtain a written admin-
istrative determination from the director concerning the owner's property classifica-
tion within a zoning district or overlay zone.

(e) Interpretation.

(1) District boundaries. Where uncertainty exists as to the boundaries of districts as
shown on the official zoning map, the following rules shall apply:

a. Boundaries indicated as approximately following the centerline of streets or
roads shall be construed to follow the centerline;

b. Boundaries indicated as approximately following platted lot lines shall be
construed as following the lot lines;

c. Boundaries indicated as approximately following the city limits shall be con-
strued as following the city limits;

d. Boundaries indicated as parallel to or extensions of centerlines, lot lines, city
limits, or similar geographical lines shall be so construed,;

e. Distances not specifically indicated on the official zoning map shall be deter-
mined by the scale of the map;

f.  Whenever any street, alley, or other public way is vacated by official action of the
city council, or whenever street or alley area is franchised for building purposes,
the zoning district line adjoining each side of such street, alley, or other public
way shall be automatically extended to the centerline of such vacated street,
alley, or way, and all area so involved shall then be subject to all regulations of the
zone districts as extended; and

g.  Where physical or cultural features exist on the ground and are at variance with
those shown on the official zoning map, or in circumstances not covered by the
subsections of this section, the city council shall interpret the zone district
boundaries.

(2) Hierarchy of zone district regulations. This article provides the uses allowable in each
zone district and the terms and standards of the overlay zone district. When a specific
standard is in conflict with a standard contained in this article or article V, regarding
the same subject matter, the more restrictive or higher standard shall govern unless
otherwise stated.

(Ord. No. 2187, § 1, 6-3-08; Ord. No. 2254, § 4, 7-7-09; Ord. No. 2279, § 2, 10-13-09; Ord. No.
2348, § 1, 11-16-10; Ord. No. 2393, § 1, 7-5-11)

Supp. No. 22 1834.22



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-92

Sec. 26-92. Use classifications.

(a) Purpose and intent. The purpose of these use classifications is to implement the policies of

the Steamboat Springs Area Community Plan, and other adopted master plans for the

Steamboat Springs area. The intent is to classify uses of land into a number of specially

defined land use categories on the basis of common functional characteristics and similar
compatibility with other uses.

(b) Use categories.

(D

(2)

3)

4)

Uses by right. Uses by right are those uses that are consistent with the purpose and
intent of the zone district and are deemed to further the preferred direction and
policies of the community plan. When development plans or final development plans
are reviewed involving a use by right, the use of the property shall not be in question.

Uses with criteria. Uses with criteria are those uses that may be consistent with the
purpose and intent of that zone district and are deemed to further the goals of the
community plan if certain criteria are considered and imposed. The criteria are
described and listed with the definition of the use in article XX, definitions and use
criteria. If the criteria for that use are met, it is presumed that the use will not have
any greater impact than a use allowed by right and the director shall approve the use
without further review. If the criteria are not met, such use shall be treated as a
conditional use. This category includes temporary events subject to the conditions and
as defined in article XX. Uses with criteria are reviewed by the director either prior to
development or building permit, as applicable, or concurrent with building permit
review, as specified within the particular use in article XX.

Conditional uses. Conditional uses are those that are generally consistent with the
purpose and intent of that zone district, yet may have more impacts to surrounding
properties and the community than uses by right or uses with criteria. Such uses
require approval pursuant to section 26-65, and conditions may be placed upon these
uses as deemed appropriate by the approval body, in order to avoid or mitigate
potential impacts. The listing of a conditional use in a particular zone district does not
ensure approval of that use or any associated development plan.

Accessory uses. Those uses defined in article IV, commercial uses that are listed in
subsection 26-92(d), summary use table, as prohibited uses, may be permitted in all
zone districts as accessory uses.

(c) Uses not specifically listed. Uses not specifically listed in any zone district may be
permitted based on the following:

(D

The director may make a determination that the proposed use is similar to another use
allowed within the zone district. In determining that a use is similar, the director shall
determine that the use is consistent with the purpose and intent section of the zone
district, and the Steamboat Springs Area Community Plan preferred direction and
policies. If a use is determined to be similar, the proposed use shall be an authorized
use with the same regulations and limitations as the use to which it was determined

Supp. No. 22 1834.23



§ 26-92 STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

to be similar. For example: A use that is determined to be similar to a use with criteria
shall be subject to the same use criteria. Uses not specifically listed that are
determined to be similar to other uses, shall be added to appropriate zone districts on
an annual basis in accordance with section 26-61.

(d) Summary use table. The uses by right, uses with criteria, and conditional uses available in
each zone are summarized in the following table:

Supp. No. 22 1834.24



§ 26-92

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE

g o)

Jrun uremp
Arurey-o[3urg

g0 | 4D | 4D | 4O

a0

40 | 4D | 940 | 9O

40 | 40 | 49D

g0

a0

40

g0

a»

40

[ejuax
ULI9}-}I0YS

40 | 40 | 4D

40

g0 | 4D

40

g0

40

40

40

jrun AIepuodeg

100loxd
asn-pexIwt

® Jo juauod
-wod [erpuep
-1sea1 ‘Suremq

syuq) +6

sy 8—¢

asnoYMmoy

=R =R =-R =g o=
~

1an0o moresung

<1
~
a1

xa[danog
/X9Id-ML

g0

40 | 40 | 4O

g0

Suiramp
Aqrurey-nmp

ooy a[IqoTY

[ejuax
uLIe)-3uor]

JIUN SIOM /PATT

g0 | 40 | ¥0 | 4D

g0

g0 | 40

g0

g0

40

g0

swoy dnoxy)

gD | 49D

a»

40 | 40 | 940 | 9O

40 | 40 | 49D

qg0

g t0)

40

jun aakoduury

] 40 | 4O

40

g0 0

40

40

xordn(

A10jTULIO(

SHSN

TVIINHAISHA

as

OL-SL
ON-#L
GON-EL
I[ON -E1

HN-GL

SO
00
NO
XD

Q 2 P
Qo o ~

3

=

qyq

oy

NY

HY

d0

+S98/)
7od1outig 21415
-adg puw uony
-021J15SD]) 25)

(spoasun4]) Suruoy (IN.L

$191.4751(] SUIU0YZ DUOINPDLT,

payqIyoId = [[9D Juelg

as() [eUORIPUO) = O

_ BLIDIID YIM 3s() = YD

Sty £q esn = ¥

sas() redrourid payIuLIdJ Jo d[qe],
©6-9¢ 219&L

1834.25

Supp. No. 22



STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

§ 26-92

punoisdure))

$901AI9S J10d
-dns sseursng

g0

g0

q0

g0

prek
Toquunyssoryd
-dns Surpying

g0 | 4D

g0

g0

g0

&)

jse}
-jealq pue pag

40

40

40 0 ¢]

ueg

sofes
aTIqowoIny

[BIUax
a[iqouwony

UoTIR)S 90TA
-I9s AIqoWoINy

q0

gD | 49O

ao

q0

aredax Jou
-TW d[IqoWOoINY

a0

qd

q0

aredau ol
-BU 9ICOWO0INY

uorje)s Surt
-9 s[rqowony

ysem
Ied 9[IqowoIny

(N.LV) dutyoey
I9[[e], dTjRWOINY

40

40

[ouUaY [RWIUY

[eyidsoy [ewruy

d q0

ad

40

OTUT TeWTuy

aanjonays
/oords Ajrusury

SHSN

"TVIDEHININOD

as

OL-GL
ON-7L
GON-EL
ION -61L

AN-GL

SO

00

NO

XD

QR
3 B B 5§ B

gy

oy

NY

HY

q0

+S98()
7od1utlg 21415

-adg puw uo1g
-0o1J18SD]) 28[)

(spoasun.]) Suruoy (IN.L

$1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.26

Supp. No. 22



@]

O

a8porT

§ 26-92

uuj

o

#10H

[a=R R R ]

OO |~K

OO0 |0

9180

40

40

40

40

uony
-ednooo awoH

qnpo> yreer

~
~

o[es adriey)

w0y [etounj

JoyIel SISULIE

q0

a0

q0

40

a0

a0

A1y
-snpur 9381300

q0

a0

qg0

40

q0

40

a0

a0

q0

ad

JoTTeI}
UOTJONIISUO))

[[ews
‘[eOI8WWO))

and

and

109] axenbs

000°0¥ 1040
‘[eISWWO))

109 axenbs
000°0¥ Iepun
pue 109] axenbs

000°GT 1040
‘[eTOIBWIWIO))

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE

910)s AI920.15)

I00pINo
‘[eISWWO))

40

40

wnIpaw
‘[eISWWO))

adxe|
[BDIOWWIO))

as

OL-GL

ON-7L

GON-EL
ION -61L

AN-GL

SO
00
NO

XD

Q
)

®
[

@
~

gy
oy
NY
HY
q0

+S98()
7od1utlg 21415

-adg puw uo1g
-0o1J18SD]) 28[)

(spoasun.]) Suruoy (IN.L

$1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.27

Supp. No. 22



STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

§ 26-92

109
-U90 UOTJBIIN]

Aqqioey
sjIe SUTULIOfId J

40

40

40

40

40

40

q0

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

Io[TRI) SO[BS
aje)so [eoy

@]

o

O
O

2JINnJoNays
/01 Sunsireq

40

o

o

O

o

a5e103s 100pINQO

se[es 100pINQ

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40 | 49O

40

dunees Io0pinQ

q0

g0

q0

g0

qg0

g0

g0

g0 | 4O

g0

Kerdstp Jo0pInQ

40

40

40

40

40 | 49O

[BIUBI JuUSI
-dmbe 1euon}R
-a0094 100pINQ

[eIuax
pue se[es juswt
-dmbe 100pInQ

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40 | 49D

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

40

sores 91e)so
[Bad 9)1s-U0 ARl
-odwag, - 90O

@]

o

[ejusp pue
[BOTPaW - 2OTJO

g0 | 4O

9O

ao

q0

ao

40

ad

40

g0

Ar9sanN

40

40

40

40

g0

40

40 | 49O

qnPIYSIN

40

40

40

40

40

40

21038
pooyIoqusteN

g0 | 49O

I97B9Y} SIAOIN

40

40

40

40

40

Ares
-uadstp vuen(
-LIBW [BOTPSAl

as

OL-GL

ON-7L

GON-EL

ION -61L

AN-GL

SO

00

NO

XD

Q
)

®
[

@
~

3

2

gy

oy

NY

HY

q0

+S98()
7od1utlg 21415

-adg puw uo1g
-0o1J18SD]) 28[)

(spoasun.]) Suruoy (IN.L

$1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.28

Supp. No. 22



§ 26-92

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE

q0

a0

ST ‘TeMysnpuy

Aneoy
‘TeLisnpuy

g0

q0

901A
-I9S [eLI}SNpU]

a»

wnLiojews.r)

g0

97010
-u0d 1o jeydse
- querd Surnypojeqg

pre£ siqowoiny

yrodary

SHSN TVIALSNANI

oJeysouwl],

gD | 490

q0

a0

40

gD | 490 qd qd q0

q0

ad

qd0

[ejuar
QUWIOY UOTJBOBA

Ay1roey uory
|N0wﬁ58800®—®rﬁ

q0

40

AwLieprxe],

40 | 49O

40

WIDAR],

orpnyg

Ayoey o3e
-10]S 90IAISS-J[9S

UT-9ALIP
‘pueine)sey

q0

ad

40

4D | 4D | 4D J

JuRINE)SAY

joed
-WI MO - 100D
-INO UOT)BIIIRY

100D
-JN0 ‘U0I)BaIIY

40 | 49O

40

40

40 | 40 | 49D ¢] ¢

I00p
-Ul “U0T)BaI9Y]

as

OL-GL
ON-7L
GON-EL
ION -61L

HN-GL

SO

00

NO

QR
3 B B 5§ B

A0

g4

oy

NY

HY

40

+S98)
7od1utlg 21415

-adg pum uoig
-0o1J18SD]) 28[)

(spoasun.]) Suruoy (IN.L

$1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.29

Supp. No. 22



199
-U9d L runuwuo))

40

40

40

agdae[ ‘101
-0 248 PIIY)

40

40

40

40

[rews 1oy
-Ued 91ed Py

Arojowa))

SHSN OIAID ANV TVNOILLNLLLSNI

Ayooey
QOmﬁu@:Oo 9)Se M\

g0

40

a8e103s 100pINO
UJIM 9SNIOYDIBAN

asnoyaIep

Ayyioey
9OTAISS JISURI],

sseulsnq Jo/pue
910)S300q pajua
-110 A[[enxeg

Ay[oey Sururery

‘[ooyos [estu
-09} ‘paje[al-e
-LIIsnpur ‘[0oyog

£y
-[oey SurAdey

40

40

40

40

Sumystqng
pue Sunurig

40

40

Jooput ‘A31[10€]
o5eI0)s [BUOSIOJ

Surury

STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

uon
-onpoad BIpay

Lyrproey
Surssedoad jesy

as

OL-GL

ON-7L

GON-EL

ION -61L

HN-GL

SO
00
NO
X0
gy

oy

NY

HY
40

+S98[)
1od1outig o110

-adg pum uo1g
-0o1J18SD]) 25[)

§ 26-92

(spoasun.]) Suruoy (IN.L

$1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.30

Supp. No. 22



§ 26-92

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE

aunj
-onIjs A108s900y

40

40

uLrej ‘rewruy

om
-SouwIop ‘[BwWIuy

g0

2IN)MOLISY

|®)
|®)
&)
|®)

|®)
|®)
&)
®)
@)

@)

punois
2A0qeR ‘SATIIII

punois
-Iopun ‘senI[)

I97U80 93RLL],

dogs jsuedy,

O|m|O|(~K
O|R|O|~k
~
a1

a1
O|R|O|~

OB |O|~k

uorje)s JISueRIL],

O|O|mk|O|/M
a1
~

wnipelg

O
O
&)
O

g0

40

9sN0Y 193]S

onqnd
/orearid-[ooyog

a1
a1
a1
O

[rews
‘aaed [RIIULPISOY

uonny
-Ijsur snoL3rey

om0y Sutsan N

WNaSNIA

o

o

OO0 |0/~

OO0 |0

|©)
®)

o

Arexqry

o

[euonnIySU]

O|O|O|I0|(0 |0

[eydsoy

pIO|IOB|k|IO|/M
RO |IO(m|M|O

om0y aaed Ar(]

®)
®)
&)

A91[108] 901A
-19s Ajrunwuro))

as

OL-GL
ON-7L
GON-EL
ION -61L

HN-GL

SO

00

NO

A0

(0}9)

Q@
g R 5 8

g4

oy

NY

HY

40

+S98)
7od1utlg 21415

-adg pum uoig
-0o1J18SD]) 28[)

(spoasun.]) Suruoy (IN.L

$1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.31

Supp. No. 22



STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

§ 26-92

(TT-G-L °T § '€6€% ON 'PIO “I1-G% G § '8LEEG ON 'PIO -0T-GT ‘T § ‘9625 ON 'PIO ‘60-T-3T ‘T §

7655 "ON P10 ‘60-€1-0T ‘€ § ‘6,35 'ON 'PXO “60-9T-9 ‘T § ‘TSGZ "ON PIO “60-9T-9 ‘T § ‘6¥2% "ON ‘P10 :80-€-9 ‘T § ‘L8T& ON 'PI0)
‘(Arepunoq JySSM o3 urt serpredoad asoy) o'T) Juewealdy uonexeuuy pesoidde ue tod pejjrunred A[reoygroeds oq Aew sesn pajIqryod.,
*10901S IUSILIIY], JO JSBD puR YJnos pajiqiyold 99] arenbs 00Q‘0g 1oA0 JuBUS] S[SUIS :9J0N

o) D xo[dwoo syr0dg

eze[d

q 4 q 4 q 4 4q q d q q q 4 1oxpod ‘ezeld
q 4 q 4 4q q 4 q 4 4 4 4 q 4 q 4 4q q 4 q q punoidLerq

sred joxod
q ! ! q q q ! ! q q q ! q 4q ! ! q q ! ! ! pooyIoquSeN
sred
q dq ! q 0 ! ! q d q ! q dq q q ! ! q pooyIoquSeN

pue[ uado
/oAT9s91d/004N08

g 4q g g L:! g ! g g L:! g g g g ! g L:! g g ! g -ol [edn)eN
q 0 0 0 0 0 0 o) o 0 0 0 o) 0 0 D | ¥aed esn [epadg
sred
q q 4 dq q J ] J O 0 0 0 o 0 0 o o) o o] q Lyrunwwo)
uap
qd g Y g L:! q 4q g g L:! g ! g g g g L:! qd g g ¥ | -1e8 Lrunwwo)
sred Aue 1o0f
o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 0 o 0 o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 o) 0 0 o osn jo a3ueY)

BLIDJLIO 99U
j0U 0p 7By} BLI
o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 0 0 ¢ O | 9L YIIm Ses(]
9sN/2IN0NIIS
o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 0 0 0 o) 0 o) 0 0 0 Arezodue,
JU2AD
40 | 4D | 9D g0 | 40 | 40 | 94D | ¥D0 | 40 | 94O | 4D g0 40 Arezodua,
g ! g g g g ! ! q ! q ! g q ! q g g q g g ST 1088900y
+S98[)
1od1outig o110
-adg pum uo1g
-0o1J18SD]) 25[)

QR
3 B B 5§ &

gy
oy
NY
HY
40

as
OL-GL
ON-7L
GON-EL
ION -61L
HN-GL
1
SO
00
NO
X0

(sprasun4f) Suruoy (N.L $1914951(] SUIU0Y DUOINPDL],

1834.32

Supp. No. 22



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-93

Sec. 26-93. Legal nonconforming uses.

(a) Purpose and intent. The purpose and intent of this section is to limit the number and
extent of nonconforming uses by prohibiting their enlargement, and their reestablishment
after abandonment. Nonconforming uses, as long as they exist, prevent the full realization of
the community plan; therefore, the spirit of these provisions is to restrict rather than increase
such nonconformance, and to eliminate such nonconformance as speedily as possible.

(b) Determination of legal nonconforming use. The director may determine that a nonconform-
ing use is a legal nonconforming use, and may allow the use to continue provided that the use
meets one of the following criteria:

(1) The nonconforming use was lawfully established prior to the effective date of this CDC;
or

(2) The nonconforming use was registered according to the requirements of the ordinances
in effect prior to the effective date of this article; or

(3) The nonconforming use was lawfully established prior to the effective date of any
amendment to this CDC that renders the use nonconforming; or

(4) The use was lawfully authorized by a permit or regulation existing prior to the
effective date of this CDC or the effective date of an amendment to this article, subject
to the limitations as prescribed by the permit(s) or regulation(s).

(¢) Administrative decision. The director shall determine whether or not a nonconforming use
is legal under the provisions of this article, based upon evidence submitted by the property
owner.

(d) Burden of proof, evidence. The burden of proof for demonstrating that a nonconforming use
is a legal nonconforming use shall be upon the property owner. All evidence and documentation
that the property owner wishes to be considered shall be submitted to the director within one

Supp. No. 22 1834.33






COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-93

year of the effective date of the ordinance that made the use nonconforming, or within sixty
(60) days of written notification by the director concerning the status of the use as illegal or
nonconforming, whichever date is later. Acceptable evidence and or documentation may
include:

(1) Public records such as sales tax receipts, property tax receipts, records from the county
assessors office and records from the department of planning and community devel-
opment, aerial photography and surveys;

(2) Signed and notarized letters from surrounding property owners containing informa-
tion about the use; and

(3) Any other evidence that documents the existence and the scope of the use at a given
point in time, in a form acceptable to the city attorney.

(e) Criteria for administrative decision. In any determination regarding the status of a
nonconforming use, the director shall determine that both of the following are met:

(1) The use is legal nonconforming as defined within this section; and

(2) Since the effective date of the ordinance that made the use nonconforming, the use did
not terminate under the provisions of subsection (h), termination of legal nonconform-
ing use.

(f) Documentation. If the director determines that the use is legal nonconforming, the director
shall document the scope of the use at the time the ordinance was adopted making the use
nonconforming. The director may require that a detailed site plan be submitted to document
and define the scope of the use.

(g) Continuance of legal nonconforming use. A legal nonconforming use shall be allowed to
continue according to the following provisions:

(1) No enlargement. The nonconforming use shall not be enlarged to occupy a greater site
area or building floor area than it occupied on the effective date of the ordinance
making the use nonconforming, except as provided in subsection (j).

(2) No relocation. The nonconforming use shall not be relocated in whole or in part to any
other lot or portion of the lot where the use is located.

(3) No additional signs. The nonconforming use shall not be extended or enlarged by the
addition of signs visible from any location off the premises.

(h) Termination of legal nonconforming use. The nonconforming status of a use shall be
terminated immediately upon any of the following:

(1) Replacement. When a nonconforming use is replaced by a conforming use such as a use
by right, use with criteria, or conditional use in the applicable zone district;

(2) Abandonment. When a nonconforming use has been abandoned or discontinued for a
period of six (6) consecutive months regardless of any intent to resume operation of
use;

Supp. No. 19 1835



§ 26-93 STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

(3) Abandonment, seasonal. When a seasonal (meaning six (6) months or less) noncon-
forming use has been abandoned or discontinued for one season regardless of any
intent to resume operation of use;

(4) Destruction of structure. When the structure(s) housing a nonconforming use is
destroyed or damaged to an extent in excess of fifty (50) percent of current reconstruc-
tion cost or when such structures are damaged or destroyed and not restored within
twelve (12) months. The director may grant an extension to the twelve-month time
limitation if a structure is of a large scale and requires changes to become compliant
with the Uniform Building Code. In such cases the applicant must apply for a building
permit within twelve (12) months, and the only changes permitted to the structure
shall be those necessary to bring the structure into compliance with the Uniform
Building Code;

(5) Condemnation of structure. When a structure housing a nonconforming use has been
officially condemned; or

(6) Relocation of structure. When a nonconforming structure or structure housing a
nonconforming use is removed from its previous site or relocated on the same or any
other site.

(i) Change to different nonconforming use. A nonconforming use shall not be changed to
another nonconforming use except where:

(1) The new nonconforming use is granted approval according to procedures used to
approve a development plan in section 26-65, and the city council finds that:

a. The new nonconforming use is determined by the director to more closely meet
the intent of this CDC; and

b. The impacts of the new nonconforming use to the surrounding properties is less
than that of the existing nonconforming use as evidenced by the response from
surrounding property owners.

(j) Expansion of legal nonconforming use.

(1) Legal nonconforming residential uses. Any structure used for single-family residential
purposes and maintained as a legal nonconforming use may be enlarged or replaced
with a similar structure of a larger size, so long as the enlargement or replacement
does not create new nonconformities or increase the extent of existing nonconformities.
Such expansions are subject to the limitations stated in subsection 26-93(h), termina-
tion of legal nonconforming use.

(2) Legal nonconforming nonresidential uses. Any structure used for nonresidential
purposes and maintained as a legal nonconforming use may be granted approval to
expand, enlarge, or increase in intensity according to procedures used to approve a
development plan in section 26-65, provided that the city council finds that:

a. The use may not expand beyond the site, lot, or parcel as defined by the legal
description on the certificate of occupancy for a nonconforming use, or as owned
or leased by the nonconforming use as of the date it became nonconforming in the
event there is no certificate of occupancy; and

Supp. No. 19 1836



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-94

b.  The proposed modification will not result in further infringement of the provi-
sions of this chapter; modifications shall comply with all regulations (other than
use restrictions), including but not limited to, lot coverage, FAR, setbacks, height,
open space, or parking requirements, unless waived by city council; and

c. The legal nonconforming use shall not be an industrial use in a residential
district. For the purpose of this section, "industrial use" shall mean those uses
identified as "industrial uses" in the table of permitted principal uses in this
CDC.

(k) Illegal nonconforming use. Nothing contained in this chapter shall be construed to allow
for the continuation of illegal uses. Illegal uses shall be removed subject to the provisions of
this CDC.

(Ord. No. 2187, § 1, 6-3-08)

Sec. 26-94. Legal nonconforming structures.

(a) Purpose and intent. The purpose and intent of this section is to limit the number and
extent of nonconforming structures by prohibiting their enlargement, or their reestablishment
after removal, demolition or destruction. Nonconforming structures, as long as they exist,
prevent the full realization of the community plan; therefore, the spirit of these provisions is
to restrict rather than increase such nonconformance and to eliminate such nonconformance
as speedily as possible.

(b) Determination of legal nonconforming structure. A nonconforming structure shall be
allowed to continue provided that the director determines that the structure meets one or more
of the following criteria:

(1) The nonconforming structure was lawfully established prior to the effective date of this
CDC; or

(2) The nonconforming structure was registered according to the requirements of the
ordinance in effect prior to the effective date of this chapter; or

(3) The nonconforming structure was lawfully established prior to the effective date of any
amendment to this CDC that renders the structure nonconforming; or

(4) The structure was lawfully authorized by a permit or regulation existing prior to the
effective date of this CDC or the effective date of an amendment to this article, subject
to the limitations as prescribed by the permit(s) or regulation(s).

(¢) Administrative decision. The director shall determine whether or not a nonconforming
structure is legal under the provisions of this article based upon evidence submitted by the
property owner.

(d) Burden of proof, evidence. The burden of proof for demonstrating that a nonconforming
structure is a legal nonconforming structure shall be upon the property owner. All evidence
and documentation that the property owner wishes to be considered shall be submitted to the
director within one year of the effective date of the ordinance that made the structure

Supp. No. 19 1837



§ 26-94 STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

nonconforming, or within sixty (60) days of written notification by the director concerning the
status of the use as illegal or nonconforming, whichever date is later. Acceptable evidence and
or documentation may include:

(1) Public records such as sales tax receipts, property tax receipts, records from the county
assessor's office and records from the department of planning and community
development, aerial photography and surveys;

(2) Signed letters from surrounding property owners containing information about the
structure;

(3) Any other evidence that documents the existence and nonconforming characteristics of
the structure at a given point in time, in a form acceptable to the city attorney.

(e) Criteria for administrative decision. In any determination regarding the status of a
nonconforming structure, the director shall determine that both of the following are met:

(1) The structure is legal nonconforming as defined within this section; and

(2) Since the effective date of the ordinance that made the structure nonconforming, the
structure has not been moved or nonconforming status did not terminate under the
provisions of subsection (j), termination of nonconforming structure.

(f) Documentation. If the director determines that the structure is legal nonconforming, the
director shall document the nature and description of the structure as it was at the time the
ordinance was adopted making the structure nonconforming. The director may require that a
detailed site plan and building elevations be submitted to document and define the structure.

(g) Continuance of legal nonconforming structure. A legal nonconforming structure shall be
allowed to continue subject to the following provisions:

(1) No enlargement. The nonconforming structure shall not be enlarged to occupy a
greater footprint, site area or volume than was occupied on the effective date of the
ordinance making the structure nonconforming, except as provided in subsection (k).

(2) No relocation. The nonconforming structure shall not be relocated in whole or in part
to any portion of the lot where the structure is located.

(h) Maintenance and repairs of nonconforming structures. Nonconforming structures and site
improvements may be maintained and repaired as necessary for convenient, safe or efficient
operation or use, provided that no such maintenance or repairs shall increase the discrepancy
between the structure or site improvements and the standards of this CDC. The maintenance
of such building or structure shall include only necessary repairs and incidental alterations,
which alterations, however, shall not extend the nonconformity of such building or structure;
provided, that necessary alterations may be made as required by other law or ordinance. If a
nonconforming structure has been condemned it may not be repaired.

(i) Restoration. The following provisions apply to restoration of nonconforming structures:

(1) If a nonconforming structure or any portion thereof is damaged or destroyed, through
no fault or intent of the owner, to the extent that the cost of restoration to its condition

Supp. No. 19 1838



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-94

before the occurrence exceeds fifty (50) percent of the total cost of reconstructing the
structure the structure may not be restored except in conformance with the current
standards, except as provided in subsection 26-94(i)(4) or (5).

(2) The cost of land or any factors other than the cost of the structure are excluded in the
determination of the cost of restoration for any structure. The extent of damage or
partial destruction shall be based upon the ratio of the estimated cost of restoration to
the same condition as prior to such damage or partial destruction to the estimated cost
of duplicating the entire structure as it existed prior thereof. Estimates of cost for this
purpose shall be made or reviewed by the building official, shall be approved by the
council and shall be based upon the minimum cost of construction in compliance with
the building code.

(3) Any nonconforming structure that is demolished or destroyed by an act of God or
nature excluding natural decay or neglect, or through any legal manner not willfully
accomplished by the owner, may be restored as of right, regardless of the extent of
demolition or destruction, if a building permit for reconstruction is issued within
twelve (12) months of the date of demolition or destruction.

(4) Restoration of residential structures. Any residential structures, including multi-
family structures, in a residential zoning district destroyed by a catastrophe, including
fire, may be reconstructed as of right up to the original size, placement and density,
regardless of the extent of demolition or destruction, if a building permit for
reconstruction is issued within twelve (12) months of the date of demolition or
destruction.

(5) Reconstruction plan. If a nonconforming commercial structure or any portion thereof
is damaged or destroyed, through no fault or intent of the owner, to the extent that the
cost of restoration to its condition before the occurrence exceeds fifty (50) percent of the
total cost of reconstructing the structure, the commercial structure may be recon-
structed provided it meets all of the regulations of the zone district in which it is
located or the structure is rebuilt according to a reconstruction plan approved by the
board of adjustment.

a. A reconstruction plan must be submitted to the board of adjustment within
twelve (12) months of the date that the damage occurred to the nonconforming
commercial structure. The director may grant an extension to the twelve-month
time limitation if the structure is of a large scale and requires changes to become
compliant with the Uniform Building Code.

b. The only alterations permitted to the commercial structure shall be those
necessary to bring the structure into compliance with the Uniform Building Code.

c.  Areconstruction plan may be approved by the board of adjustment if it finds that
the proposed reconstruction minimizes infringement of this CDC consistent with
the specific reconstruction needs of the structure. The board of adjustment may
condition such approval to mitigate the detrimental effects of infringement of this
CDC by any portion of the nonconforming building or structure.

Supp. No. 19 1839



§ 26-94 STEAMBOAT SPRINGS REVISED MUNICIPAL CODE

() Termination of legal nonconforming structure. The nonconforming status of a structure
shall be terminated immediately upon any of the following:

(1) Replacement. When a nonconforming structure is replaced by a conforming structure.

(2) Destruction of structure. When the structure is destroyed or damaged to an extent in
excess of fifty (50) percent of current reconstruction cost or when such structures are
damaged or destroyed and not restored within six (6) months.

(3) Condemnation of structure. When a nonconforming structure has been officially
condemned.

(4) Relocation of structure. When a nonconforming structure is removed from its previous
site or relocated on the same or another site.

(k) Expansion of legal nonconforming structures. Any building or structure nonconforming as
to lot coverage, setbacks, height, open space, density provisions or parking requirements may
be enlarged, remodeled or renovated provided such alterations conform to the regulations of
the district in which it is located. In such case, such addition or enlargement shall not result
in new nonconformities or an increase of existing nonconformities with all of the requirements
of this CDC.

(1) Illegal nonconforming structures. Nothing contained in this chapter shall be construed to
allow for the continuation of illegal structures. Illegal structures shall be removed subject to
the provisions of this CDC.
(Ord. No. 2187, § 1, 6-3-08)

Sec. 26-95. Nonconforming lots.

(a) Purpose and intent. The intent and purpose of this section is to prohibit any change to
nonconforming lots that would increase the degree of nonconformity of that lot. Any expansion,
or increase in the nonconformity of a lot will prevent the full realization of the community plan
as it is expressed in this CDC.

(b) Determination of legal nonconforming lot. A nonconforming lot shall be allowed to continue
provided that the lot meets one of the following criteria:

(1) The nonconforming lot was lawfully established prior to the effective of this CDC; or

(2) The nonconforming lot was registered according to the requirements of the ordinance
in effect prior to the effective date of this chapter; or

(3) The nonconforming lot was lawfully established prior to the effective date of any
amendment to this CDC that renders the structure nonconforming; or

(4) The lot was lawfully authorized by a permit or regulation existing prior to the effective
date of this Code or the effective date of an amendment to this article, subject to the
limitation as prescribed by the permit(s) or regulations(s); or

Supp. No. 19 1840



(5)

(6)

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT CODE § 26-130

The lot is contained within a legal subdivision plat recorded at the county clerk and
recorder's office, where the recording date of the plat precedes the date of the ordinance
that rendered the lot nonconforming; or

The lot was created as a result of a foreclosure of a deed of trust, or other court decision.

(¢c) Development of a legal nonconforming lot. Any nonconforming lot of record may be

developed if the following conditions exist:

(D
(2)

3)

4)

The lot of record is not contiguous to lots held in the same ownership; or

The nonconforming lot is combined with any contiguous lot(s) under common owner-
ship to eliminate the nonconformity or reduce the degree of nonconformity to the
greatest degree possible. Common ownership shall include any combination of hus-
band, wife, son, daughter, father, mother, cousin, and any corporation where any
combination of such individuals maintain a controlling interest; and

The lot does not meet the minimum lot size in the zone district, but the proposed
structure can be accommodated with side and rear setbacks that have been adjusted
as shown below to reflect the small size of the lot.

a. Minimum adjusted side setback = Standard side setback in the zone district
multiplied by (size of lot/minimum lot size permitted in the zone district);

b. Minimum adjusted rear setback = Standard rear setback in the zone district
multiplied by (size of lot/minimum lot size permitted in the zone district);

c.  No such change shall permit any side or rear setback to be reduced by more than
twenty (20) percent.

The proposed single-family dwelling unit can be located on the lot so that the yard,
height, open space, and floor area ratio dimensional requirements of the zone district
can be met, or a variance is obtained from the dimensional requirements pursuant to
the provisions of section 26-70, variances.

(d) Lot reduction.

(1)

(2)

3

No lot or interest therein shall be transferred, conveyed, sold or subdivided so as to
create a new nonconforming lot, to avoid, circumvent, or subvert any provision of this
article, or to leave remaining any lot in violation of the dimensional requirements of
this article.

No lot or portion of a lot required as a building site under these provisions shall be used
as a portion of a lot required as a building site for another structure.

No building permit shall be issued for any lot or parcel of land that has been conveyed,
sold, or subdivided in violation of this section.

(Ord. No. 2187, § 1, 6-3-08)

Secs. 26-96—26-130. Reserved.

Supp. No. 19 1841



	Muni_Code_Supp_22.pdf
	Steamboat Springs Revised Municipal Code
	Officials At Time of Codification
	Current Officials
	Preface
	Adopting Ordinance
	Table of Contents
	Checklist of Up-to-Date Pages
	Supplement History Table
	Charter
	Charter Comparative Table
	Chapter 1. General Provisions
	Chapter 2. Administration
	Chapter 3. Alcoholic Beverages
	Chapter 4. Animals
	Chapter 5. Buildings and Building Regulations
	Chapter 6. Elections
	Cghapter 7. Environmental Control
	Chapter 8. Reserved
	Chapter 9. Reserved
	Chapter 10. General Offenses
	Chapter 11. Health and Human Services
	Chapter 12. Licenses, Permits and Miscellaneous Business Regulations
	Chapter 13. Local Improvements
	Chapter 14. Municipal Court
	Chapter 15. Nuisances
	Chapter 16. Parks and Recreation
	Chapter 17. Reserved
	Chapter 18. Reserved
	Chapter 19. Solid Waste
	Chapter 20. Streets and Sidewalks
	Chapter 21. Subdivisions
	Chapter 22. Taxation
	Chapter 23. Traffic
	Chapter 24. Trees and Shrubs
	Chapter 25. Water, Sewers and Sewage Disposal
	Chapter 26. Community Development Code
	Chapter 27. Watershed Protection
	Code Comparative Table -- 1975 Code
	Code Comparative Table -- Ordinances
	State Law Reference Table
	Charter Index
	Code Index




